
Funders in Alamance County   

 

 

 

 

Alamance Community Foundation  

The Alamance Community Foundation exists to strengthen Alamance County for present 
and future generations through inspired and collaborative giving. Community Grants are 
awarded to Alamance County non-profit organizations to improve lives and support the 
community. Grant amounts typically range from $1,000 to $5,000. ACF currently manages 
seventeen funds that award scholarships to Alamance County high school seniors headed 
to institutions of higher learning. 

Office Address: 133 East Davis Street, Burlington, NC 27216 

Office Phone: 336.395.5347 

Website: Community Grants — Alamance Community Foundation 

 

 

 

Bank of America  

Bank of America develops strong partnerships with nonprofit organizations focused on 

issues fundamental to economic mobility in low- and moderate-income communities. They 

focus on improving the lives of individuals and families by investing in health, jobs, and 

strengthening broader community vitality by addressing needs related to small business 

resiliency, and community development. They support vulnerable populations, including 

working families, youth, seniors, individuals living with disabilities, veterans, and those 

impacted by the criminal justice system. 

Website: Bank of America resources: grants, sponsorships & ESG reports 

https://www.alamancecommunityfoundation.org/community-grants
https://about.bankofamerica.com/en/making-an-impact/find-resources


 

 

 

 

 

Cone Health  

Cone health is a private, not-for-profit organization which was established to serve the 
community by providing a full range of health care services distinguished by measurable 
excellence. The founding principles of community service and superior patient care are the 
cornerstones of the organization. Cone Health has dedicated significant resources to these 
efforts and takes a system-wide, inclusive approach to the decision-making process around 
sponsorships, grants, and volunteer commitments. 

Website: Apply for a Grant or Sponsorship | Cone Health 

 

   

 

 

Impact Alamance 

Impact Alamance is a community health foundation created from the merger of Alamance 
Regional and Cone Health. This foundation partners and invests to achieve health, hope and 
prosperity for everyone in our county. They believe that everyone should be able to live 
healthy and fulfilling lives—no matter their race, gender, or economic status. Impact 
Alamance invests in local nonprofits and programs that strengthen systems and 
environments, ensuring all children and their families have what they need to create a 
strong foundation that leads to lasting results. They have three main funding focus areas: 
healthier, smarter, and stronger.  

Office Address: 133 E Davis St, Burlington, NC 27215 

Office Phone: (336) 221-0011 

Website: Impact Alamance – Healthier Community, Healthier Future 

https://www.conehealth.com/about-us/apply-for-a-grant-or-sponsorship/
https://impactalamance.org/


 

 

 

 

 

Employees’ Credit Union  

At the State Employees’ Credit Union, grants are directed toward non-profits and 
governmental organizations that demonstrate the Credit Union philosophy of people 
helping people. The SECU Foundation promotes local and community development by 
mainly funding high-impact projects in housing, education, healthcare, and human services.  

Website: SECU Foundation – Grants (ncsecufoundation.org) 

 

     

  

 

 

Truliant Federal Credit Union 

Truliant FCU has a commitment to community and the credit union’s social responsibility 
to give back to the neighbors we serve. The Truliant Foundation elevates the “People 
Helping People” credit union philosophy by providing donations, grants and scholarships 
to the community and relief funds to employees facing unforeseen personal hardships. 
Additionally, The Truliant Foundation provides support through programs and funding 
initiatives to established non-profit organizations aligned with Truliant’s community focus 
areas including youth and education, financial wellness, economic mobility, and community 
development.  

Website: Community Mini Grants | Grants for Non-Profit Organizations (truliantfcu.org) 

 

 

https://www.ncsecufoundation.org/Grants/Grants.html
https://www.truliantfcu.org/about-us/community/mini-grants


 

 

 

 

United Way of Alamance County 

The mission of United Way of Alamance County is to radically decrease the number of 
families in poverty by advancing social equity practices that promote social mobility and 
provide opportunities to build a resilient community. This organization envisions a 
community that comes together to break down barriers, eliminate inequities, and end 
poverty. Funding occurs in the areas of health, education and financial stability, with a 
diverse team of community volunteers vetting the applications and making fund 
recommendations to the United Way Program Committee.  

Office Address: 220 East Front Street, Burlington, NC  27215 

Office Phone: 336.438.2000 

Website: United Way of Alamance County | (uwalamance.org) 

 

 

 

 

Wells Fargo Foundation 

Wells Fargo provides grants to nonprofits that focus on financial well-being, housing 

affordability, small business growth, and sustainability. Their goal is to provide funding to 

address societal issues, including housing. They partner with national and local nonprofit 

organizations. 

Website: https://www.wellsfargo.com/about/corporate-responsibility/community-giving/grant-

process/   

         

 

https://www.uwalamance.org/
https://www.wellsfargo.com/about/corporate-responsibility/community-giving/grant-process/
https://www.wellsfargo.com/about/corporate-responsibility/community-giving/grant-process/


      

Other Funders 

    

 

Ben and Jerry’s 

The National Grassroots Organizing Program offers two-year flexible, general operating 

support grants of up to $30,000 per year, with an average grant size of $20,000 per year, to 

small, non-profit grassroots constituent-led organizations throughout the United States and 

its territories and that are not located in the state of Vermont. 

Website: National Grants - Ben & Jerry's Foundation (benandjerrysfoundation.org) 

 

 

 

Mary Reynolds Babcock Foundation 

The Babcock Foundation partners with organizations and networks working to alleviate poverty 

and increase social and economic justice in 11 Southern states. They believe in democracy, 

opportunity and the power of partnerships, and we follow the lead of local experts who know 

what their communities need to thrive. They support collaborative, multi-strategy, place-based 

work focused on democracy and civic engagement, economic opportunity, and supportive 

policies and institutions. The Babcock Foundation invites proposals from local, statewide, 

regional and national nonprofits serving the South that have track records of helping people and 

places move out of poverty and achieve greater social and economic justice. 

Website: Grants | Mary Reynolds Babcock Foundation (mrbf.org) 

 

       

https://benandjerrysfoundation.org/national-grants/
https://www.mrbf.org/grants


 

 

 

Robert Wood Johnson Foundation  

The Robert Wood Johnson Foundation funds programs focused on improving health and 

well-being in many sectors, aiming to create a “culture of health.” They focus on programs 

that improve equity, especially for low-income populations. Their focus areas are health 
leadership, health systems, healthy communities, and healthy families.  

Website: Grants and Grant Programs (rwjf.org) 

 

 

 

Z. Smith Reynolds 

The Z. Smith Reynolds Foundation (ZSR) is committed to improving the quality of life for all 

North Carolinians. The Z. Smith Reynolds Foundation is a statewide, private, family 

foundation that has been a catalyst for positive change in North Carolina for more than 85 

years. Headquartered in Winston-Salem, NC, the Foundation has invested more than $667 

million into North Carolina. The Progress Fund grant cycle allows the Foundation to 

support communities and to better understand how different communities experience 
change, opportunity, and challenges in unique ways. 

Website: Grants | Z. Smith Reynolds Foundation (zsr.org) 

   

 

                   

 

 

 

https://www.rwjf.org/en/grants.html
https://www.zsr.org/grants-programs/grants

